Government of Punjab

Department of School Education

To,

1. Director of Public Instruction (SE, EE) Punjab.
2 Director, SCERT, Punjab.

3. Director General School Education. ‘ . 4
4. All the District Education Officers.

Memo No: 1‘7//13//7 - 5%5//0#57//

Dated: o‘?/,, ) 1020

Subject:- Circulation of updated copy of Punjab Civil Services
(General and Common Conditions of Service) Rules, 1994.

1.0 Earlier the service conditions of persons appointed to various services
of the Department of School Education were being governed by very old rules
framed in the year of 1941, 1955, 1978, 1995 and 2004. With the passage of time,
the old rules had become virtually outlived. Thus, in order to frame new sets of
Rules governing recruitment and service conditions of persons appointed to
‘various services, Department of Schoo! Education had prepared a comprehensive
proposal to frame new sets of Rules after obtaining the concurrence of Department
of Finance, Department of Personnel and Punjab Public Service Commission and
 after obtaining the approval of Council of Ministers, the various sets of rules were
duly notitied vide different notiﬁcations.AA list of such Rules is attached at
Annexure-] to this letter.
2.0 In all of the aforesaid Rules, a Rule regarding application of the
Punjab Civil Services (General and Common Conditions of Service) Rules, 1994

stands incorporated in the following wording:-

" In respect of the matters, which are not specifically provided in
these rules, the members of the Service shall be governed by the
provisions of the Punjab Civil Services (General and Common
Conditions of Service) Rules, 1994, as amended from time to time.
(2) The Punjab Civil Services (General and Common Conditions
\ P of Service) Rules, 1994, at present in force, are contained in

/ Appendix 'C""



T ~
I

3.0\J Thus, as per provisions contained in the aforesaid all sets of
Departmental Service Rules, the members of the Service shall be governed by the
provisions of the Punjab Civil Services (General and Common Conditions of
Service) Rules, 1994, as amended from time to time. Therefore, irrespective of
provisions mentioned in Appendix 'C" of the above said Rules, the provisions of
the Punjab Civil Services (General and Common Conditions of Service) Rules,
1994, as amended from time to time are also applicable to the members of Service
of various services whose recruitment and conditions of service are governed and
regulated by the aforesaid sets of Departmental Service Rules.

4.0 Recently, the Department of Personnel prepared a booklet containing
the updated copy of the Punjab Civil Services (General and Common Conditions
of Service) Rules, 1994, as amended from time to time and incorporating the
amendments made in the said Rules till 13.9.2019. Though, as per statutory
provisions contained in the Rules, the amended provisions of the said Rules of
1994 are also applicable to all members of service, still in order to remove any
prevalhng confusion and to provide updated 1nformat10n a copy of the said
booklet is sent for the information of all concerned and is attached at Annexure-2
to this letter.

5.0 While reading out the provisions as contained in Appendix 'C' of
various sets of Departmental Service Rules, the amended provisions of Rules of

1994 as contained in the said booklet may also be kept in view.

/————7“
Secretary School Education.




Annexure-|

'sr. | Name of Rule Date of Notification

No ]

1 Punjab Educational Service (School and Inspection Border 7" June,2018
Area) Group- 'A' Service Rules .

2 Punjab Educational Service (School and Inspection Cadre 7" June,2018
General) Group- 'A' Service Rules

3 Punjab Educational Service (School and Inspection Border 8th August,2018
Area) Group 'B' Service Rules

4 | Punjab Educational Service (School and Inspection) Group- 8" August,2018
'B' Service Rules .

5 Punjab Educational Service (Teaching cadre) Border Area 21 May, 2018
Group- ‘C’ Service Rules, 2018 .

6 Punjab Educational Service (Teaching cadre) Group- g 21 May, 2018
Service Rules, 2018 '

7 Punjab Education Department (Ministerial Staff of 7™ June,2018 ‘
Headquarter) Group A Service Rules, 2018

8 Punjab Education Department (Ministerial Staff of 8™ Aug, 2018
Headquarter) Group B Service Rules, 2018

9 Punjab Education Department Ministerial and Non Teaching 10" May,2018
Staff (Headquarter) Group C Service Rules, 2018

10 | Punjab Education Department (Ministerial Staff of 8" Aug, 2018

| subordinate Offices) Group B Service Rules, 2018

11 | Punjab Education Department Ministerial Staff ( Border 8™ Aug, 2018
Area) Group B Service Rules, 2018 '

12 | Punjab Education Department Ministerial and Non Teaching 10™ May,2018
Staff (Subordinate Offices) Group C Service Rules, 2018

13 | Punjab Education Department Ministerial and Non Teaching 10™ May,2018
Staff (Border Area) Group C Service Rules, 2018

14 | Punjab Educational Service ( Vocational) Group B Service 8" Aug, 2018
Rules, 2018

15 | Punjab Educational Service ( Vocational) Border Area Group 8" Aug, 2018
B Service Rules, 2018 (8" Aug, 2018)

16 | Punjab State Elementary Education (Administrative Cadre) 8™ Aug, 2018
Border Area Group 'B' service Rules,2018

17 | Punjab State Elementary Education (Administrative Cadre) g™ Aug, 2018

'| Group 'B' service Rules, 2018 .

18 | Punjab State Elementary Education (Teaching Cadre) Border 21% May, 2018
Area Group C Service Rules,2018

19 | Punjab State Elementary Education (Teaching Cadre) Group 21% May, 2018
C Service Rules,2018




Aa N EexuRE I

For Official Use Only

GOVERNMENT OF PUNJAB

DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL

THE PUNJAB CIVIL SERVICES
(GENERALAND COMMON CONDITIONS OF SERVICE)
RULES, 1994

(As amended upto 30th September, 2016)

Scanned with CamScanner



1

GOVERNMENT OF PUNJAB
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL
(I’ERSONNBL POLICIES-1 BRANCH)

Notification
The 4th May, 1994

NO. GS.R. 33/Const./Art.309/94. - In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to article 309 of the

Constitution of India, and all other powers enabling in this behalf, the Governor 0 of Pumab is pleased to make the

following rules regulating the recruitment and general and common conditions of service of persons appointed td

'[Group ‘A, Group 3’ and Group ‘C’] services in connection with the aﬁ‘axrs of the State of Punjab, namely:-
1. Short title, commencement and application :-
(1) These rules may be called the Punjab Civil Services (General and Common Conditions of Service)
Rules, 1994. » a
(2) They shall come into force at once.
(3) They shall apply to all the posts in '[Group ‘A, GIOUP ‘B’ and Group «C] services in coﬁncction with

the affairs of the State of Punjab

2. Definitions.- In these rules, unless the context otherwise requires,- _

a) “appointing authority” means an appointing authority specified as such inthe Service Rules made under

© article 309 of the Constitution of India in respect of any service or Post in connection _Withhtﬁe affairs
of the State of Punjab; | L R

p) “Board” means the Subordinate Service Selection Board, Punjab or any other authority constituted to

perform its functions;

c) «Commission” means the Punjab Public Service Commission;

-

dy “direct appointment” means an appointment made otherwise than by promotion or by transfer of a

person alr eady in the servnce of Govemment of India or of a State Government; -

e) “Government” means the Government of the State of Punjab in the Department of Personnel and

s

Administrative Reforms, o .
)] wrecognised univer sity or institution means,” ‘ '

) any university of msututwn incorporated by law in any of the State of India; or

j)  anyother university or institution, which is declared by the Govemmentto be recognised university

or msntutlon for the purposes of these rules;

["selvnce * eans any Gloup ‘A" Service, Group ‘B’ Service and Group ‘C’ Service constituted in

g
: ection with the affairs of the State of Punjab as per s scales gwen in the Appendix;)

~ conn
h) “Service Rules” means the service rules made under article 309 of the Constitution of India regulatmg
the rect qitment and conditions of service other than the general and common conditions of service of

persons dppomted (o‘any service or post in connection with the affairs of the State of Punjab; and

———

i Améndcd — = Punjab Govermner! Notification No.GS.R.115/Const/ AT 3007AMd (62001, datcd 18" December, 2001

Scanned with CamScanher



2
ary forces personnel, who is a bona fig,

0y (i) "War hero™ means a defence services personnel, or a para- -milit 2 bona
n killed or dischar ged hom service on account o dtsabnny

by the Gover
suftered by him on or after I January, 1999, while fighting in a war declared ;o ty ey tnmem of
with Pakis
. India, in operations in Kargil or any other sector in) & K intheon going conl 1 : ) ::"I\‘" in
en un
any other operations which may be notified by the State Govemment to have been undertaken f,,

resident of Punjab State and has bee

preserving the unity and mte;,l ity of the Country; or

a para-military forces pelsonnel who was a bona Side resident of
Mahavnr Chakra or Vir Chakry:

(i) a defence service personnel or
Punjab State and was pos(humously decorated with Param Vir Chakra,

provided that,- ‘
(1) In exceptional instances, the cases of such War Heroes ‘may also be covered, with the prior
~ approval of the Department of Personnel who though not bona fide residents of Punjab State are

yet closely connected to the State of Punjab;

-

(b)  ln the case of War Heroes, falling in the category (ii) above, the benefits to be given by the State
Government will be restricted only to first generation dependent members/next of the Kin.

Note:-The Government reserves the right to include any other category of Awardees for the purpose of
providing employment to the category of War Heroes, as may be notified.]

3. Nationality, domicile and character of person appointed to the Service.-
(1) No person shall be appointed to the Service unles§ he is,-
(a) acCitizen of India; or |
_(b) aCitizen of Nepal; or
(¢) a Subject of Bhutan; or

(d) aTibetan refugee who came over to India before the 1* day of January, ]962 with the intention of
permanently settling in India; or

(e) aperson of Indian origin who has migrated from Pakistan, Burma Sri Lanka and East Afncm
Countries of Kenya, Uganda and United Republic of Tanzania ( formerly Tanganyika and
Zanzibar), Zambia, Malawi, Zaire, Ethiopia and Vietn

am with the intention of permanently settling
in India: | o

‘.

Provided that a person belonging to any of the categories (b), (c), (d) and (e) shall bea person in whose
favour a certificate of eligibility has been given by the Government
of Punjab in the De e
fvoura et j \ partment of Hon
(2) A person in whose case a certificate of eligibility is necessa
interview conducted by the Commission or the Board, as the
he has applied for the certificate-but he shall not be
certificate is given to him by the Government of Punjab i

ry may be admitted to an examination or

case inay be, on his furnishing proof that
appointed to the ser vice unless the necessary

i the Department of Home Affairs and Justice.
(3)  No person shall be recruited to the service by direct appomtmem unless | d
ie produces,-

a) ~ acertificate of character fromlhepuncmalac

ad
ademic OfT'cel of the university, college, SChO
' c,ubsllwle" vide Punjab Government Notification No.GS.R.34/Const./Ar. 309/ Amd. (7)/2003 d ted 12" Jul
ated 12 July,

2003.

Scanned with CamScanner



3

Jastitution last attended, if any, and similar certificates from two responsible persons not being his
relatives, who are well acquainted with him inhis private life and are unconnected with himin  his
private life and are unconneeted with his university, college, school or institution; and

(b  An affidavit to the effect that he was never convicted for any criminal offence involving moral
turpitude and that he was never dismissed or removed from service of any State Government or

of Government of India, or of any public Sector Undertaking.

4. Disqnmliﬁcntinn.- No person;-

(a) whohas entered into or contracted a marriage with a person having spouse living ; or

) (b) who, havinga spouse living, has entered into o contracted a marriage with any person shall be eligible

for appointment to the Service :
rmissible under the personal

are other grounds for

Provided that the Government, [ satisfied that such marriage is pe
jaw applicable to such person and the other party to the marriage and that there
so doing, exempt any person from the operation of this rule.
ice by direct appointment, if he is less than eighteen years or
case of technical and non-technical posts on the first day

ate, fixed for submission of applications by the

5, Age.- '[ (1) No person shall be recruited to the Serv
is more than thirty seven years of age in the
of January of the year immediately preceding the lastd
Commission or the Board, as the case may be.] _

provided that where difterent lower and upper age limits have been spéciﬁcally prescribed for
these limits shalt be made applicable for appointment to such posts:

posts in the Service Rules,

provided further that the upper age limit méy be relaxed upto focty-five years in the case of

persons already in the employment of the Punjab Government, other State Government or the Government

of India.
provided further that in the case

Classes, the upper age [imit shall be suchas m
the upper age limit shall be such as has been prescribed in the Punjab

(2) Inthe case of ex-servicemen,
Recruitment of Ex-servicemen Rules, 1982, as amended from time to time.

of candidates belonging to Scheduled Castes and other Backward
ay be fixed by the Government from time to time-

(3) In thecasc of appointment on compassionate grounds on priority basis, the upper age limit shall be such

cally fixed by the Government  from time (o time.
2[(4) In the case of appointment of a Wm'-hero., who ha.s been‘dns?harged from defence services or para-
y suffered by him or his widow or dependent member of his family,

es on account of disabilit
(imit shall be such as may be specifically fixed by the Government from time to time]

t.— Notwithstanding anything contained in rule 5, 0n and with effect from the,
il Services (General and Common Conditions of Service) Amendment
¢ rules, orin Government instructions, the upper age Jimit for appointment
rsons, il different from thirty-five years, it shall be deemed to have

as may be specifi

military forc
the upper age
3[SA. Increase inupper age limi
commencement of the Punjab Civ
Rules, 2010, where in any other Servic
to any Service OF for any category or pe
been increased by two years. |

- —
nent Notification No.GS.R.20/(?ous(./}\rt.3()9/A|1\d.(l0) 12010, dated 24 May, 2010.

' Amended vide Punjab Govern
ification No.GS.R.8 l/(Tunsl.l/\rl._3()‘)/Amd(ll)/‘)‘), dated 15% November, 1999,
unjab Government Notification No,GS.R.Z()/(’.fonsl./Arl.30‘)/Amd.(l()) 12010, dated 24" May, 2010.

? Amended vide Punjab Government No

3Rule 5A after rule 5 was inserted vide P

Scanned with CamScanner



&

4 .
nd character of \‘po‘s.ts, method of

’ : er @
of these rules, the numbc o ‘
b storpostsina Service and

ttoapo
the Service Ru!es made for that

6. Qualification etc.- Subject (o the pnovnsnon \
intmen
recruitment and educational qualifications and experience for appoin

Clﬁed in
the departmental cxanunatlon if any, shall be such as may be Spe

Service; | .
f 2[Group ‘A’ or Group ‘B’] non- technical post is offered to a
fence services or paramilitary forces on account of -disability

under the instructions issued in this

behalf by the Government, the educational qualification to be possessed by such person shall be graduation

from a recognised university. Such person who is offered [Group ‘A’ or Group ‘B’ or Group ‘C’] non-

technical post, shall not, however, be required to posses experience of technical or‘no‘n-te_clm’lcal post at the o

'{Provided that where appointment 0
war-hero, who has been dischar ged from de
suffered by him or his widow or dependent member of his family,

time of his initial appomtmem.}

7. Probation.- (1) A person appointed to any post in the service shall remain on probation for a penod of

Y|three] years, if recruited by direct appomtmenl and one year |fappomted otherwise:

Provided lhat -

(a) 'my period, after such appointment, spent on deputahon ona corres.pondmg ora hlgher post shall

~ count towards the period of probation;

~(b) in the case of an appointment by transfer, any per iod of wonk on an equivalent or hlghar rank,
priorto appomtment to the Service, may n the discretion of the appointing authority, be allowed to

”
'

*“count towards the period of probation;

(c). any periodof ommatmg appomtment to (he Service shall be reckoned as period spent on probation,
and '

(d) any kind of leave not exceeding six months, durmg, orat the end of period of probation, shall be
counted towards the perlod of probanon '

(2) If, in the 0pmlon of the appomtmg authonty, the work or conduct of a person during the penod of .
~ probation is not satasfactm y or if he has failed to pass the departmental examination, if any prescribed
in Service Rules within a per lOd not exceeding *[one] and a half ,
years from the date of
- appomtmem it
(a) - ifsuch person is recruited by direct dppomtment dlspense wnth his . serwce:;; ér re;rert himt
post on which he held lien prior to his appomtment to the Service by direct appointment; m:l o
ent; an
(b) ifsuch penson is appointed otherwise- '

(i) revert himto his former post; or

(i) deal with him in such other manner as the t o
erms and c
permit. . ONdmons of the previous 8ppomtment

1 proviso was added, vide Punjab Govemment Notification No. G. S.R.81/Const./Art. 309/A d ‘ |
2 A mended vide Punjab Government Notification No.G.S.R.115/Const./ Art. 309/Amd, (6)/20:11 (:)/99 dated ol NOVCmbel' %
ated 18"

3 Amcnded vide Punjab Government Notification No. G.S.R:1/Const./Art. 3091Amd (14)/20|
5, dated
+Amended vide Punjab Gover nmentNonncanon No. G.S.R.56/Const./Art. 309/Amd Qa 8) /20 . : ed 23
‘ : ated 5*

Dccember, 2001
“ February, 2015,
® September, 2016.

Scanned with CamScanner



(93

(3) Onthe completion of the period of probation of a person, the appointing authority may -
(a) i his work and conduct has in its opinion been satisfactory - -

(iy  confirmsuch person, from the date of his appointment or from the date he completes his period of
probation satisfactorily, if he is not already confirmed; or

@iy  declare that he has completed his probation satisfactorily, if he is already confirmed; or

(b) ilhis work or conduct has not been in its apinion, satisfactory or ifhe has failed to pass the departmental
examination, if any, speciﬁed in the Service Rules -

“

()  dispense with his services, if appointed by direct appointmentor if appointed otherwise revert him
to his former post, or deal with him in such other manner as the terms and conditions of his
previous appointment may permit;

(i) extend his period of probation and thereafter pass such order as it could have passed on the
expiry of the period of probation as specified insub-rule (1):

Provided that the total period ol probatign including extension, if any, shall not exceed three years.

Seniority - The seniority inter s¢ of persons appointed to posts in each cadre of a Service shall be determined
by the length of continuous service on such post in that cadre of the Service.

Provided that in the case of persons recruited by direct appointment who join within the period specified
in the order of appointment or within such period as may be extended from time to time by the appointing
authority subject to a maximum of four months {rom the date of order of appointment the order of merit
determined by the Commission or the Board, as the case may be, shall not be disturbed:

Provided further that in case a person is permitted to join the pbst after the expiry of the said period of
four months in consultation with the Commission or the Board, as the case may be, his seniority shall be
determined from the date he joins the post: '

provided further that in case any person of the next selection has joined a post in the cadre of the
ed Service before the person referred to in the preceding proviso joins, the person so referred shall be
all the persons of the next selection who join within the time specified in the first proviso:

concern
placed below
Provided further that in the case of two or more persons appointed on the same date, their seniority shall

be determined as follows:-
(a) aperson appointed by direct appointment shall be senior to a person appointed otherwise;

(b) aperson appointed by promotion shall be senior (o a person appointed by transfer;

pbintcd by promotion ot transfer, the seniority shall be determined

(c) in the case of persons ap
ich persons in the appointments from which they were promoted or

accordingtothe seniority of st
(ransferced; and

in the case of persons appointed by wransfer from dilferent cadres their seniority shall b‘e determined
being given (o a person who was drawing a higher rate of pay in his

(d)
according (o payy preference
previous appointment; and if the rates of pay drawn are also the same, then by their length of
service in these appointments and if the length of service is also the same, an older person shall be

senior to a younger person:

Scanned with CamScanner




9.

10.

1.

13.

4.

O

. ) . . . - onent in the same cadre obtaining
'|Provided further that in the case of persons recruited by direct appointmentin th g

equal marks during same selection process, their inter-se-seniority shnll be determined oq the basis of their
age. That is, an older person shall be senior to the younger persom, | g ‘A ’
Nmé:- Seniority of persons appointed on purely provisional basis or on ad hoe basis sfmll be determined as
and when they are regularly appointed keeping in view the dates of such regular appointment.

Liability of members of Service to transfer - A member ol a Service may be trans.fcrrcfi to any post
whether included in any other service ornot, on the same terms and conditions as are specified in rule 3.17 of
the Punjab Civil Service Rules, Volume-1, Part 1.

Liability to serve - A member ol a Service shall be liable to serve atany place, whether within or out of the
State of Punjab, on being ordered so to do by the appointing authority.

Leave, Pension and other matters - In respect of pay, leave, pension and all other matters not expressly

provided for in these rules, a member of a Service shall be governed by such rules and regulations as may
have been or may hereafter be adopted or made by the competent authority.

Discipline, penalties and appeals - (1) In the matter of discipline, punishment and appeals, a member of a

Service shall be governed by the Punjab Civil Services (Punishment and Appeal) Rules, 1970 as amended
from time fo time.

(2) Theauthority empowered to impose penalties specified in rule 5 of the Punjab Civil Services (Punishment

and Appeal) Rules, 1970 and the appellate authority thereunder in respect of the Government employee
shall be such as may be specified in the Service Rules.

Liability for vaccination and re-vaccination - Lvery member ol a Service shall get himself vaccinated or
re-vaccinated when Punjab Government so directs by a special or general order.

Oath of allegiance - Every member of a Service, unless he has already done so, shall be required to take
oath of allegiance to India and to the Constitution of India as by law established.

tAmended vide Punjub Government Notification No.(15.R,1 l/(‘.’onsl.//\n.3()‘)/mml.( 17 2016

duted 19w January, 2016,

Scanned with CamScanner




7 v .
114A. Minimum Educational and other Qualifications for appointment to the post of Senior Assistant
Direct Appointment Promotion
No person shall be given direct appointment (o From amongst the clerks, who have an
the post of Senior Assistant under the Punjab experience of working as such fora
Government unless he -- . minimum period of five years.

(i) Possesses the Bachelor’s Degree from
recognised University or Institution; and

(i) Qualilies in the competitive test specified by the

appointing authority from time to time; and

(i) Paossessesat leastone hundred and twenty hours
course with hands on  experience in the use of
* Personal Computer or Information Technology in
Office Productivity applications or Desktop
Publishing applications from a Government recognised
institution or a reputed institution, which is 1SO 9001, .
certified. '
OR

Possesses a Computer Information Technology
Course equivalent to *O’ level certificate of
| Department of Electronics Accreditation of Computer
Course (DOEACC) of Government of India.

(2) The person so appointed as Senior Assistant in

terms of the Provisions of sub-rule (1), shall have,

before his appointment, *[passed a test in English and

Punjabi, respectively,] typewriting on computer to be

conducted by the Board or the appointing authority or

the Department of tnformation Technology, as the

case. may be, at a speed of thirty words per minute:
‘Provided that where appointment of Group ‘B’

non-technical post is offered to a War Hero, who has

been discharged from Defence Services or dependent

member of his family under the instructions issued in ~ )

this behalf by the Government, the educational

qualifications to be possessed by such person shall be

Graduate froma recognised University or Institution.

However, such person shall not be required to quality

the test in Punjabi type-writing as Provided in sub-

rule (2).

A}

\Rule 14A was inserted vide Punjab Government Notification No. GS.R.7/Const/Art.300/Amd.(15)2015 dated 15% March, 2015.
. Amended vide Punjab Government Notification No. GiS.R.69/Const./Ar.309/Amd.(16)/2015 dated 24* December, 2015,

Scanned with CamScanner



S

115, Minimum Educational and other qualifications:-

M M

)

(i

2

No person shall be given direct appointment to the post of Clerk under  the Punjab Government
unless he possesses the Bachelor’s Degree from a recognised University or Institution; and

-

Possesses at least one hundred and twenty hours course with hands on experience in the use of
Personal Computer or Information Technology in Office Productivity apphcatmns or Desktop

Publishing applications from a Government recognised institution or a reputed institution, which is
1ISO 9001, certified.

OR

Possesses a Computer information Technology course equivalent to *O” level certificate of

Department of Electronics Accreditation of Computer Course (DOEACC) of Government of

India.;

The person so appointed as Clerk in terms of the provisions of sub-rule(1), shall have, before his
appointment, *(passed a test in English and Punjabi, respectively, on computer), to be conducted

by the Board or the appointing authority or the Department of Information Technology as the case
may be, at a speed of thirty words per minute.".

Provided that where appointment of Group ‘C’non-technical post is offered to a War Hero,
who has been discharged from Defence Services or dependent member of his family under the
instructions issued in this behalf by the Government, the educational qualification to be possessed
by such person shall be Graduate from a recognised University or Institution. However, such
person shall not be required to qualify the test in Punjabi type-writing as specified in sub-rule (2).]

'Rulel5 was Substituted, vide Punjab Government Notification No.G.S.R.12/Const./Art.309/ Amd (9)/2009 dated 10%
February, 2009.

Rule15 was amended and sub rule (3) was Omitted vide Punjab Government Notification No. GS.R.59 /Const/ Art 309/Amd.(13)/
2011, dated 17" August, 201 1.

2Amended vide Punjab Government Notifi cation No. G.S.R.69/Const./Art, 30‘)/Amd (16)12015, dated 24 Decemb er, 2015.

Scanned with CamScanner

\




"15A. Minimum Educ

Stenographer by —

0

ational and other Qualifications for

appointment to the post of Senior Scale

Direct Appointment

Promotion

No person shall be given direct appointment 10 the
post of Senior Scale Stenographer under the Punjab
Government unless he -

(i) Possesses the Bachelor’s Degree

from a

recognised University or Institution; and

s (i) Qualifies in a Stenography test in four paras (WO
in Punjabi and two in English language) comaining

250 words each as follows :-

(a) the passage in Punjabi shall be dictated at a

(i)

(iv)

(b)

speed of 100 words per minute in Punjabi
language required to be transcribed these
(at typewriter/computer) at a speed ol 20
words per minute; and

the passage in English shall be dictated ata
speed of 60 words per minute in English
language required to be transcribed these
(at typewriter/computel‘) at the speed of 12
words per minute.

The candidates committing not more than
4% mistakes in aggregate and only if he/
she qualifies the stenography test in both
the languages shall be considered to have
qualified the test for appointment as Senior
Scale Stenographer”.

Possesses at least one hundred and twenty
hours course with hands on experience
in the use of personal Computer or
Information Technology in Office
Productivity applications or Desktop
Publishing applications from a Government

‘recognised institution or areputed institution,

which is ISO 0001, certified.
OR ‘

Possesses @ Computer information
Technology course equivalent to O’ level
certificate of Department of Electronics
Accrcditatio'n of Computer Course

(DOEACC) of Government of India.

0]

(i)

(a)

(b)

| (i)

From the Junior Scale
Stenographers, who have an experience of

amongst

working as such for a minimum period of
one year. .
Provided that if the Junior Scale
Stenographer is not available then from
amongst the Steno typists, who have an
experience of working as such for a
minimum period of five years; and

Qualifies in astenogra phy test in four paras
(twoin Punjabi and two in English language)
containing 250 words each as follows:-

the passage in Punjabi shall be dictated ata
speed of 100 words per minute in Punjabi
language required to be transcribed these
(at typewriter/computer) at 4 speed of 20
words per minute; and

the passage in En glish shall be dictated at
a speed of 60 words per minute in English
language required to be transcribed these
(at typewriter/computer) at the speed of 12
words per minute. ‘

The candidates committing not more than
4% mistakes in aggregate and only if he /
she qualifies the Stenography test in both
the languages shall be considered to have
qualified the test for promotion as Senior
Scale Stenographer.”

e ————

IRule 15A was inserted vide P

unjab Government Notilication No. (iS.R,“I/Const./An,J()‘)/Amd.(\5)/20\5 dated 15" March, 2015.

Scanned with CamScanner




10

. T . : teno-typist or Junior
'116.  Minimum Educational and other Qualifications for appointment to the post of S ' yp Jumior Seal
o, . . ~Q -typist Or Jui ale
" Secale Stenographer - No person shall be given direct appomtment to the post of Steno-typ

Stenographer under the Punjab Government, unless he -

) M ; : H Q1 11 1 M d
(a) Possesses Bachelor’s Degree from a recognised University or Institution;and

. e : dor inting authority at a speed
(b) Qualifies a testin Punjabi Stenography to be held by the Board or by the appointinga yatasp

specified by the Government [rom time to time; and

(¢) Possesses at least one hundred and twenty hours course with hands on experience in the use of Personal

. . . . " st ' ishi lication :
Computer or Information Technology in Oftice Productivity applications or Desktop Publishing applications . :
from Government recognised institution or a reputed institution, which is 150 9001, certified.

- OR ) - m

Possesses a Computer information Technology Course equivalent to *O’ level certificate of Department
of Clectronics Accreditation of Computer Course (DOEACC) of Government of India.]

[

[17.  Knowledge of Punjabi Language - No person shall be appointed to any post in any service by direct
appointment unless he has passed Matriculation examination with Punjabi as one of the compulsory or elective

subjects or any other equivalent examination in Punjabi language, which may be specified by the Government
from time 1o time: ' '

Provided that where a person is appointed on compassionate grounds on priority basis under the instructions
issued in this behalf by the Government (rom time to time, the person so appointed shall have to pass an
examination of Punjabi language equivalent to Matriculation standard or he shall have to qualify a test conducted

by the Language Wing of the Department of Education of Punjab Government within a period of six months
from the date of his appointment: '

Provided further that where educational qualifications for a post in any service are lower than the

Matriculation standard, then the person so appointed shall have to pass an examination of Punjabi language
o

equivalent to Middle standard:

Provided further that where a War Hero, who has been discharged from defence services or paramilitary
forces on account of disability suffered by him or his widow or dependent membe ' 3
under the instructions issued in this behalf by the Governn
possess aforesaid knowledge of Punjabi language: |

rofhis family, is appointed
ppointed will not be required to

]

ent, the personsoa

Provided further that where a ward of Defence Service Personnel, who is a bon,
State, is appointed by direct appointment, he shall have to pass
to Matriculation Standard or he shall have to qualify
of Education of Punjab Government within

! a fide resident of Punjab
an examination of Punjabi Language equivalent

i a te?t conducted by the Language Wing of the Department
A period of two years from the date of his appointment,)

'Amended vide Punjab Government Notification No.G.S.R. 12/¢

onst/Ar.309/ Amg 9)2009
i i i V009, dat h
"Rule 17 was Substituted vide Punjab Government Notification No.G.S.R. ' w0

. February, 2009
97)Ca "~ ] .
2001, | T/Const./Art 309 Amd.(5)2

001, dated 4% September,

.

Scanned with CamScanner



1t

'[18.  Promotion to Group *A’ and Group ‘I’ Services -

(1) (a) Forpromotion to the post as Head of Department would be decided strictly on the basis ol merit-
cum-seniority as per the instructions issued by the Government from time to time. The minimum
bench mark for promotion for such post would be “Very Good’. The officer who is graded as
“Outstanding” would supersede the officer graded as *Very Good’.

(b)  Forpromotion to post falling in Group “ A’ other than | lead of Department, the minimum benchmark
will be *Very Good® as per the instructions issued by the Government from time to time. There

shall be no supersession on the basis of merit.
(¢)  Forpromotion to post falling in Group *B’, the minimum benchmark will be *Good’ and there shall
be no supersession on the basis of merit.

(2) Debarring for consideration for promotion of a Gov_ernnicm employee who refuses to accept
promotion - In the event of refusal to accept promotion by a member of a service, he shall be
debarred by the appointing authority {rom consideration for promotion for all the consecutive chances
which may occur in future within a period of two years from the date of such refusal to accept promotion:

Provided that ina case where the appointing authority is satisfied thata member of a service has
refused to accept promation under the circumstances beyond his control, it may exempt such a member
for reasons to be recorded therefor in writing from the operation of this rule.]

19. Power to relax. - Where the government is of the opinion that it is necessary to expedient so to do, it may by
order, for reasons to be recorded in writing, relax any of the provisions of these rules with respect to any class
or category of persons. ‘ *

Provided that the provisions relating to educational qualifications and experience, if any, shall not be
relaxed. '

50.  Over riding effect - The provisions of these rules shall have effect notwithstanding anything contrary

contained in any rules for the time being in force for regulating the recruitment and conditions of service for

appoiniment to public service and posts in connection with the affairs of the State.
21.  Interpretation - If any, question arises as to the interpretation of these rules, the Government shall decide

the same.

Rule 18 was Substituted vide Punjib Government Notification No.GS.R. 1 7/Const/Art.309/Amd.(7) 22001, dated 18" December, 2001

Scanned with éamScanner



12

“APPENDIX”
| (See rule 2)

Group*A’ :  Posts ininitial entry revised scales of pay havinga maximum of Rs. 11,660 or more; Provided

that all existing Class | posts irrespective of the monetary limits of the pay scales shall be
placed in Group ‘A’

Group*B’ :  Posts in initial entry revised scales of pay with maximum ranging between Rs. 10,640 to
11,659;

Group‘C’ :  Posts in initial entry revised scales of pay with maximum ranging between Rs. 5,160 to
10,639; - '

Kok kK

A.S. CHATTHA,
Chief Secretary to Government of Punjab.

I

Appendix was inserted vide Punjab Government Notification No.GiS.R.115/Const./ Art.309/Amd.(6)/2001, dated 18* December, 2001.

Punjab Govt Press, S.A.S. Nagar/9173/11-2016(5)

Scanned with CamScanner



N

PUNJAB GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), DECEMBER 23,2016 1045
(PASUA 2, 1938 SAKA) '

"~ PART 111
GOVERNMENT OF PUNJAB

DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL
(PERSONNEL POLICIES-1 BRANCH)

NOTIFICATION
The 20th December, 2016 .

No.G.S.R. BS/Const./Art.309/Amd.(l9)/2016.-ln exercise of the
powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of India
and all other powers enabling him in this behalf, thé Governor of Punjab is
pleased to make the following rules, further to amend the Punjab Civil Services
(General and Common Conditions of Service) Rules, 1994, némely -

v RULES
l. (1) Theserulesmay be called the Punjab Civil Services (General and
Common Conditions of Service) (Third Amendment) Rules, 2016,

(2) They shall come into force on and with effect from the date
of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. Inthe Punjab Civil Services (General and Common Conditions of Service)

Rules, 1994, inrule 5, in the second proviso, for the words and sign "Punjab
Government”, the words "Punjab Government or any Board, Corporation,

. Commission or Authority under it", shall be substituted.

SARVESH KAUSHAL,
Chief Secretary to Government of Punjab.

1 166/12-2016/Ph. Gowi. Press, S.A.5. Nagar

Scanned with CamScanner

i



PUNJAB

GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), OCTOBER 10, 2017 11sl
(ASVN 18,1939 SAKA)

PART 111
GOVERNMENT OF PUNJAB

DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL
(Personnel Policies-1 Branch)

NOTIFICATION
" The 4th October, 2017

No. G.S.R.Mléonst./Art.309IAmd,(20)12,017.-ln exercise of the
poWers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of India and
all other powers enabling him in this behalf, the Governor of Punjab is pleased
to make the following rules further to amend the Punjab Civil Services (General

"and Common Conditions of Service) Rules, 1994, namely :--

RULES

1. (1) These rules may be called the Punjab Civil Services (General and
Common Conditions of Service) (Amendment) Rules, 2017.

(2) They shall come into force on and with effect from the date of
their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. InthePunjab

Civil Services (Gencral and Common Conditions of Service)

Rules, 1994, in rule 7, in sub-rule (3), for the existing proviso, the following
proviso shall be substituted, namely:- :

wprovided -that the total period of probation including
extension, ifany, shall not exceed four years, if recruited
by direct appointment and three years if appointed
otherwise." -

1350/10-2017/Pb. G

. 'KARAN AVTAR SINGH,
Chief Sccretary to Government of Punjab.

ovt, Press, S.A.S. Nagar

'Scanned with CamScanner



e —
e R RS I s g et e e en o ot
R e R i L o

PUNJAB GOVT, GAZ. (EXTRA), SEPTEMBER 16,2019 469
(BHDR 25, 1941 SAKA)
PART I
GOVERNMENT OF PUNJAB
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL
(Personnel Policies-1 Branch)
NOTIFICATION
The 13th September, 201 9

No. G.8.R.31/Const./Art.30%/Amd,(21)/2019.- In exercise of the
powers conferred by proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of India and all
other powers enabling him in this behalf, the Governor of Punjab is pleased to
make the following rules further to amend the Punjab Civil Services (General
and Common Conditions of Service) Rules, 1994, namely -

RULES

v L) These rules may be calied the Punjab Civil Services (General and
i Common Conditions of Service) (First Amendment) Rules, 2019.

(2) They shall come into force on and with effect from the date of
their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. Inthe Punjab Civil Services (General and Common Conditions of Service)
Rules, 1994, (hereinafter referred to as the said rules), in rule 14 A, under
column captioned as * Promotion”, for the words “five years", the words "four
years” shall be substilated.

3. Inthesaid rules, inrule 1SA, under column captioned as “Promotion”, in
clause (i) in the proviso, for the words "five years", the words “four years"
shall be substituted,

KARAN AVTAR SINGH, |
Chief Secretary to Government of Punjab.

186/9-2019/Pb. Govt. Press, $.A.8. Nagar

Scanned with CamScanner



